What shall we do?
Pay him the amount or negotiate. Es war also schon bei der Polizei?!
LG Lutz

---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: Bavarian Sausage Company Phuket / M.D. Assistant <m.d.assistant@kandl.asia>
Date: 2011/8/3
Subject: RE: lawyer
To: Lutz Mueller <lutz.asia@gmail.com>


I was with him yesterday.
Unfortunately that K&W is a criminal case and it was already in the police’s hand since before khun Rene went out of country.
So when he comes back he has to withdraw case from the police first and then negotiate 
 
 


From: Lutz Mueller [mailto:lutz.asia@gmail.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, August 03, 2011 10:15 AM
To: m.d.assistant@kandl.asia
Subject: Re: lawyer
 

Dear Khun Tammy,
he told me THB 10.000 for the 3 letters, I have the feeling he is getting a little bit to hungry? K6W will be paid from Germany this Friday latest next Monday
RGD
Lutz

2011/8/3 Bavarian Sausage Company Phuket / M.D. Assistant <m.d.assistant@kandl.asia>

I already ask Lawyer to send letter from Law office to Vimami he charge 5,000 ( have to pay him in advance)
For K&W Cheque case with the police he asked 50,000 THB  to ask the police stop arresting Rene and negotiate K&W to pay back 20,000/month with No court case.
